

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Macon Supply	Ferguson	Fortiline	Consolidated	Eng Equip.	Dublin Winwater	Core & Main
		Address	Douglas, Ga	Macon, Ga	Macon, Ga	Jacksonville, Fl	Waycross, Ga	Albany, Ga	Dublin, Ga	Tallahassee, FL.
Group A - PVC Pipe & Fittings										
1	50 EA	ADAPTER MALE 1" PVC TO MIP SCH 80 #836-010. (201019)	\$103.50	\$137.50	\$129.00	\$100.50	No Bid	\$178.50	\$104.50	\$166.50
2	25 EA	ADAPTER FEMALE 1" PVC-FIP SCH 80 #835-010 FOR WATER 25/BX (201028)	\$47.75	\$98.50	\$53.50	\$46.25	No Bid	\$82.25	\$63.75	\$76.75
3	100 EA	ADAPTER FEMALE 3/4" PVC-FIP SCH 80 #835-007 (201029)	\$130.00	\$172.00	\$161.00	\$126.00	No Bid	\$223.00	\$173.00	\$208.00
4	40 EA	ADAPTER MALE 2" PVC SCH 80 (PVC X MIP)#836-020. (201020)	\$201.60	\$266.80	\$252.00	\$190.00	No Bid	\$347.20	\$269.20	\$340.80
5	25 EA	CAP 2" P V C SLIP SCH 40 25/BX LASCO# 447-020BC (201060)	\$10.25	\$14.75	\$9.00	\$11.25	No Bid	\$12.50	\$11.50	\$14.50
6	30 EA	COMBINATION 4" PVC DWV SLIP (301019)	\$624.30	\$678.60	\$546.30	\$617.10	No Bid	\$653.70	\$354.90	\$465.90
7	25 EA	COUPLING 1" BAND TYPE PVC SCH 80 SLIP X SLIP 25/BX (201089)	\$32.50	\$42.75	\$40.00	\$31.50	No Bid	\$55.75	\$43.25	\$54.75
8	50 EA	COUPLING 2" BAND TYPE PVC SCH 80 SLIP X SLIP #829-020 10/BX (201090)	\$114.00	\$151.00	\$137.50	\$110.50	No Bid	\$196.50	\$152.00	\$186.50
9	100 EA	ELLS 3/4" PVC 90 DEGREE SCH 80 #806-007 (201141)	\$66.00	\$87.00	\$78.00	\$68.00	No Bid	\$114.00	\$87.00	\$112.00
10	50 EA	ELLS 1" PVC 90 DEGREE SCH 80 #806-010 (201142)	\$53.00	\$70.50	\$66.00	\$55.00	No Bid	\$91.50	\$71.00	\$89.50
11	50 EA	ELLS 2" PVC 90 DEGREE SCH 80 SLIP X SLIP(201143)	\$91.50	\$121.50	\$111.50	\$89.00	No Bid	\$158.00	\$152.00	\$155.00
12	20 EA	ELLS 4" PVC DWV 45 DEGREE BEND SLIP, D321-040. (301035)	\$137.20	\$151.60	\$109.00	\$142.60	No Bid	\$143.60	\$81.60	\$82.40
13	10 EA	ELLS 4" PVC DWV 90 DEGREE BEND SLIP (301036)	\$82.60	\$74.40	\$72.00	\$83.50	No Bid	\$86.40	\$51.30	\$63.80
14	25 EA	REDUCER 2" X 3/4" PVC (SLIP X SLIP) SCH 40 #437-248 (201318)	\$50.00	\$21.75	\$12.75	\$16.50	No Bid	\$18.25	\$16.75	\$24.00
15	25 EA	TEE 1 X 3/4 PVC SCH 40 SLIP (201418)	\$10.25	\$14.75	\$10.00	\$12.00	No Bid	\$12.50	\$11.75	\$25.50
16	25 EA	TEE 1" PVC SCH 40 SLIP, #401-010 (201419)	\$9.00	\$13.00	\$8.00	\$10.75	No Bid	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$14.50
17	25 EA	TEE 2" PVC SCH 40 SLIP, #401-020 (201422)	\$24.50	\$35.75	\$21.50	\$27.00	No Bid	\$30.00	\$28.25	\$39.75
18	10 EA	TEE 4" PVC DWV (301071)	\$112.20	\$123.00	\$100.60	\$203.70	No Bid	\$117.50	\$69.60	\$202.50
19	50 EA	VALVE BALL 1" PVC SCH 80 SLIP X SLIP, #770S05G (201434)	\$129.00	\$203.50	\$895.00	\$114.00	No Bid	\$137.50	\$120.00	\$1,296.00
20	200 EA	VALVE BALL 3/4" PVC SCH 80 SLIP X SLIP, #770S04G (201436)	\$368.00	\$566.00	\$3,380.00	\$322.00	No Bid	\$394.00	\$352.00	\$4,746.00
Total of Group A			\$2,397.15	\$3,044.65	\$6,192.65	\$2,377.15	No Bid	\$3,063.65	\$2,223.35	\$8,364.65

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Macon Supply	Ferguson	Fortiline	Consolidated	Eng Equip.	Dublin Winwater	Core & Main
		Group B - Galvanized Fittings								
1	25 EA	CAPS 3/4 GALV (201061)	\$28.25	\$44.00	\$46.25	\$31.00	\$32.00	\$49.25	\$35.75	\$72.50
2	12 EA	CAP 1" GALV(201062)	\$14.76	\$23.04	\$24.48	\$16.20	\$16.08	\$41.76	\$18.72	\$43.08
3	25 EA	ELLS 1" GALV 90 DEGREE REG(201131)	\$42.00	\$65.50	\$69.00	\$46.25	\$44.00	\$104.00	\$28.50	\$107.50
4	10 EA	ELLS 2" GALV 90 DEGREE REG(201134)	\$56.90	\$88.70	\$93.60	\$73.40	\$57.10	\$140.70	\$21.30	\$55.50
5	25 EA	NIPPLE 3/4 X 5 1/2 GALV(201246)	\$30.50	\$50.25	\$48.75	\$32.25	\$24.25	\$63.75	\$38.25	\$94.50
6	25 EA	NIPPLE 3/4 X 4 1/2 GALV(201244)	\$25.25	\$42.00	\$40.50	\$28.75	\$21.50	\$53.25	\$31.75	\$78.25
7	25 EA	NIPPLE 1 X 2 1/2 GALV (201250)	\$23.75	\$39.50	\$38.00	\$27.00	\$19.00	\$50.00	\$29.75	\$73.75
8	50 EA	NIPPLE 1 X 4 GALV. (201253)	\$57.50	\$95.00	\$91.50	\$61.00	\$47.00	\$120.50	\$72.50	\$177.50
9	25 EA	NIPPLE 1 X 5 GALV (201255)	\$35.25	\$58.25	\$56.00	\$37.25	\$28.00	\$74.00	\$44.25	\$109.25
10	25 EA	NIPPLE 1 X 5 1/2 GALV (201256)	\$40.00	\$66.25	\$64.00	\$42.25	\$33.00	\$84.25	\$50.00	\$123.75
11	20 EA	NIPPLE 2 X 6 GALV(201065)	\$67.40	\$111.20	\$107.40	\$71.60	\$52.60	\$141.20	\$84.40	\$208.40
		Total of Group B	\$421.56	\$683.69	\$679.48	\$466.95	\$374.53	\$922.66	\$455.17	\$1,143.98
		Group C - Lead Free Brass Fittings								
1	50 EA	ADAPTER FEMALE 3/4 LEAD-FREE BRASS CF-FIP X CTS FORD FC1433NL, AY McDONALD #74754-22 3/4 OR APPROVED EQUAL (201016)	No Bid	\$720.50	\$695.00	\$609.00	\$637.50	\$749.00	No Bid	\$943.50
2	30 EA	CORP STOP 3/4" LEAD-FREE BRASS CC X COMP FOR CTS / PE TUBING FORD FF10003NL AY MCDONALD 74701-22 3/4 OR MUELLER APPROVED EQUAL ONLY (201080)	No Bid	\$894.00	\$867.00	\$757.80	\$784.50	\$931.80	No Bid	\$927.60
3	10 EA	CORP STOP 1" LEAD-FREE BRASS FOR CTS / PE TUBING FORD FF10004NL AY MCDONALD 74701-22 1 OR MUELLER APPROVED EQUAL ONLY(201081)	No Bid	\$452.00	\$440.10	\$382.10	\$392.50	\$469.70	No Bid	\$486.30
4	50 EA	COUPLING 3/4" LEAD-FREE BRASS COMP X COMP FOR CTS TUBING FORD FC4433NL OR APPROVED EQUAL.(201077)	No Bid	\$834.50	\$806.50	\$705.00	\$730.00	\$866.50	No Bid	\$897.00
5	20 EA	COUPLING 1" LEAD-FREE BRASS COMP X COMP FOR CTS TUBING FC4444NL OR APPROVED EQUAL (201078)	No Bid	\$381.80	\$369.40	\$322.80	\$315.00	\$396.80	No Bid	\$391.60
6	25 EA	ELBOW 3/4" LEAD-FREE BRASS COMPRESSION 90 DEGREE FOR PE TUBING CTS 200 PSI FL4433NL (201128)	No Bid	\$538.75	\$521.00	\$455.25	\$445.00	\$560.00	No Bid	\$606.00
7	24 EA	HOSE BIBB 3/4" LEAD-FREE BRONZE MIP ARROW 302LF OR APPROVE EQUAL (US MADE ONLY) (201205)	No Bid	\$184.80	\$210.00	\$430.56	\$204.00	\$195.60	No Bid	\$186.48

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Macon Supply	Ferguson	Fortiline	Consolidated	Eng Equip.	Dublin Winwater	Core & Main
8	30 EA	REDUCER BUSHING 1 1/4 X 3/4 LEAD-FREE BRASS (201319)	No Bid	\$321.60	\$115.20	\$157.80	\$120.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$327.00
9	25 EA	TEE COMPRESSION 3/4 LEAD-FREE BRASS FOR PE TUBING CTS 200 PSI FT444333NL, AY MCDONLAD 74760-22 3/4 (201420)	No Bid	\$1,009.75	\$980.25	\$853.75	\$832.50	\$1,049.25	No Bid	\$1,133.25
10	125 EA	VALVE BACKFLOW 3/4" LEAD-FREE BRONZE METER SWIVEL X FIP DUAL CHECK FORD, COMBRACO 4N-3S5-4B,WATTS# LF7R10-U2 OR APPROVED EQUAL. (201466)	No Bid	\$3,186.25	\$3,112.50	\$6,123.75	\$2,962.50	\$2,956.25	No Bid	\$6,908.75
11	40 EA	VALVE STRAIGHT LOCKING 3/4 X 5/8"X3/4" LEAD-FREE BRASS FIP XFIP BALL FORD B11-333-NL, AY MCDONALD 76101W 3/4X5/8X3/4 OR APPROVED EQUAL.(201458)	No Bid	\$1,233.20	\$1,196.00	\$1,655.20	\$1,082.00	\$1,281.20	No Bid	\$1,474.80
12	10 EA	VALVE STRAIGHT LOCKING 1" LEAD-FREE FIP X FIP BALL FORD B11-444-NL, AY MCDONALD 76101W 1X3/4X1 OR APPROVED EQUAL (201459)	No Bid	\$544.10	\$528.20	\$634.20	\$476.00	\$545.40	No Bid	\$649.20
13	10 EA	VALVE LOCKWING STOP ANGLE LEAD-FREE BRASS 3/4"X 5/8"X3/4" METER SWIVEL X COMP FOR CTS/PE TUBING FBA43232WNL, AY MCDONALD 74642B-22 3/4 OR APPROVED EQUAL (201460)	No Bid	\$406.10	\$397.50	\$343.30	\$356.00	\$421.90	No Bid	\$419.60
14	10 EA	VALVE LOCKWING STOP ANGLE 1" METER SWIVEL X COMP LEAD-FREE BRASS FOR CTS/PE TUBING FBA43444WNL OR EQUAL.(201461)	No Bid	\$825.00	\$1,039.40	\$697.40	\$704.00	\$1,081.40	No Bid	\$574.70
15	40 EA	VALVE STRAIGHT LOCKING 3/4 X 5/8 X 3/4 LEAD FREE BRASS METER SWIVEL X COMPRESSION FORD #FB43232WNL, AY MCDONALD 76100MW-22 3/4X5/8X3/4 OR APPROVED EQUAL (201462)	No Bid	\$1,647.20	\$1,594.00	\$2,130.80	\$1,444.00	\$1,711.60	No Bid	\$2,370.80
Total of Group C			No Bid	\$13,179.55	\$12,872.05	\$16,258.71	\$11,485.50	\$13,402.40	No Bid	\$18,296.58
Group D - Dresser Couplings #65 Long No-Sub										
1	50 EA	COUPLING DRESSER 3/4 QUICK STYLE #65 LONG NO-SUB (201365)	No Bid	\$808.50	\$502.50	\$771.50	\$557.50	\$606.50	\$623.50	\$645.50
2	10 EA	COUPLING DRESSER 1" QUICK STYLE #65 LONG NO-SUB (201366)	No Bid	\$184.00	\$114.20	\$208.20	\$125.50	\$142.70	\$141.90	\$146.80
3	10 EA	COUPLING DRESSER 1 1/4" QUICK STYLE #65 LONG NO-SUB (201367)	No Bid	\$135.70	\$174.50	\$210.90	\$152.50	\$183.00	\$182.10	\$188.40

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Macon Supply	Ferguson	Fortiline	Consolidated	Eng Equip.	Dublin Winwater	Core & Main
4	50 EA	COUPLING DRESSER 2" QUICK STYLE #65-0035-003 LONG NO-SUB 10/BX (201369)	No Bid	\$1,671.00	\$1,112.50	\$1,341.00	\$1,192.50	\$1,344.00	\$1,431.00	\$1,431.00
Total of Group D			No Bid	\$2,799.20	\$1,903.70	\$2,531.60	\$2,028.00	\$2,276.20	\$2,378.50	\$2,411.70
Group E - Item by Item										
1	128 EA	BOX METER CAST IRON SIGMA #1910 10"X19"X10"DIP NO-SUB. 32/PALLET (201042)	No Bid	\$4,125.44	\$4,509.44	\$4,819.20	\$4,499.20	\$4,433.92	\$4,224.00	\$4,683.52
2	50 EA	COUPLING RUBBER 4" PVC X 4" TC W/BANDS FERNCO APPROVED EQUAL. 50/BX (301024)	\$135.00	\$221.50	\$187.50	\$249.50	\$175.00	\$178.00	DMS	\$244.50
3	6 EA	COUPLING RUBBER 8" PVC X 8" PVC W/BANDS FERNCO APPROVED EQUAL (301028)	No Bid	\$87.24	\$72.60	\$98.58	\$76.50	\$70.08	\$75.12	\$86.70
4	25 EA	EXTENSION WATER VALVE BOX 1" STACKABLE D.I. (201160)	No Bid	\$274.00	\$105.00	\$167.75	\$125.00	\$214.50	\$159.75	\$191.75
5	25 EA	EXTENSION WATER VALVE BOX 2" STACKABLE C.I (201161)	No Bid	\$338.50	\$256.25	\$244.00	\$180.00	\$243.00	\$208.50	\$250.00
6	25 EA	EXTENSION WATER VALVE BOX 1 1/2" STACKABLE C.I (201162)	No Bid	\$306.25	\$163.00	\$198.25	\$137.50	\$228.75	\$180.75	\$216.75
7	144 EA	HOT GLUE PVC PINT CAN (HOT MEDIUM BLUE LAVA PVC CEMENT) #32162-55990 OR APPROVED EQUAL.(403132)	\$721.44	\$1,170.72	\$1,461.60	\$1,481.76	\$842.40	\$1,080.00	\$1,008.00	\$1,818.72
8	500 EA	INSERT WATER PIPE 3/4" SS FORD # 51 FOR PE TUBING 200 PSI AY McDONALD #6133T 3/4 (201207)	No Bid	\$760.00	\$690.00	\$650.00	No Bid	\$670.00	\$595.00	\$865.00
9	400 EA	INSERT WATER PIPE 1" SS FORD #52 FOR PE TUBING 200 PSI AY McDONALD #6133T 1 100/BAG (201208)	No Bid	\$640.00	\$584.00	\$552.00	No Bid	\$568.00	\$540.00	\$732.00
10	10 EA	MANHOLE RING & COVER TRAFFIC MODEL 24" CI U.S. MADE ONLY(301050)	No Bid	\$1,900.00	No Bid	\$1,793.80	\$1,700.00	\$1,660.50	\$1,709.20	\$1,814.50
11	24 EA	PIPE CLEANER FOR ALL PVC QT SIZE #30805-55934(201073)	\$129.60	\$258.96	\$205.44	\$240.00	\$240.00	\$190.08	\$211.20	\$319.92
12	10 EA	SADDLE TAPPING 6 X 2 IP TAP WIDE SINGLE STRAP STAINLESS STEEL FOR C-900 PVC JCM 4 OR FORD NO-SUB(201349)	No Bid	\$450.70	\$412.80	\$427.20	\$351.50	\$306.20	\$258.50	No Bid
13	5 EA	TAPE SEWER LINE DETECTION GREEN 2 X 1000'(201378)	No Bid	\$125.75	\$80.00	\$73.70	\$75.00	\$57.15	\$72.50	\$113.10
14	10 EA	TAPE WATER LINE BURIED 2" X 1000' DETECTABLE(201379)	No Bid	\$215.50	\$180.00	\$148.60	\$150.00	\$114.30	\$145.00	\$226.20

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Macon Supply	Ferguson	Fortiline	Consolidated	Eng Equip.	Dublin Winwater	Core & Main
15	10 EA	TAPE GAS LINE BURIED 3"X 1000' PLASTIC YELLOW WITH BLACK LETTERING "CAUTION GAS LINE BELOW (601085)	No Bid	\$312.50	\$180.00	No Bid	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$145.00	No Bid
16	500 EA	WASHERS 3/4" RUBBER APPROX. 1/8" THICK TO FIT WATER METER COUPLINGS. 100/BAG (201468)	No Bid	\$95.00	\$50.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$75.00	No Bid	\$60.00
17	500 EA	WASHERS 1" RUBBER APPROX. 1/8" THICK TO FIT WATER METER COUPLINGS 100/BAG (201469)	No Bid	\$175.00	\$55.00	\$40.00	\$50.00	\$90.00	No Bid	\$70.00

Total Awarded to Vendor

Awarded Bid Totals \$1,407.60 \$4,125.44 \$2,008.70 \$80.00 \$11,803.00 \$1,902.03 \$3,761.85 \$0.00

Vendor	Group(s)	Total
Coley Electric - Douglas, GA	Group B, Line Items: 2,7,11	\$1,407.60
Macon Supply - Macon, GA	Line Items: 1	\$4,125.44
Ferguson - Macon, Ga	Group D, Line Items: 4	\$2,008.70
Fortiline - Jacksonville, FL	Line Items: 16,17	\$80.00
Consolidated Pipe - Waycross, GA	Group C, Line Items: 5,6	\$11,803.00
Engineering & Equip - Albany, GA	Line Items: 3,6,10,13,14	\$1,902.03
Dublin Winwater - Dublin, GA	Group A, Line Items: 8,9,12,15	\$3,761.85
Grand Total of All Bids		<u>\$25,088.62</u>

Section E line item 16 was decided by coin toss, witnessed by Anthony Folsom

Vendors not responding:

No Bids from:

Lanier Municipal Supply Co, Lakeland Ga
 Utilities Supply, Inc., Winder, Ga

HD Supply, Tallahassee, FL
 Lowe Electric, Tifton, GA