

City of Douglas
2019 Utility Electrical Supplies Bid

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO
		Address	Douglas, GA	Kennesaw, GA	Norcross, GA	Forsyth, GA	Havana, FL	Tifton, GA	Fairburn, GA
GALV BOLTS									
1	50 EA	BOLTS D A 5/8" X 40" GALV HOT DIPPED U.S. MADE ONLY (101067)	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,055.00	\$782.50	DMS	No Bid	\$320.00
2	25 EA	BOLTS DA 5/8" X 26" GALV. J-8876 OR REA APPROVED U.S.MADE ONLY (101076)	No Bid	No Bid	\$147.50	\$90.00	DMS	No Bid	\$103.50
3	50 EA	BOLT MACHINE 3/4" X 12" GALV. JOSYN 8912 OR REA APPROVED EQUAL U.S. MADE ONLY.(101087)	No Bid	No Bid	\$138.00	\$97.50	DMS	No Bid	\$437.50
4	150 EA	BOLTS MACHINE 5/8 X 5 GALV J-8805 OR REA APPROVED EQUAL U.S. MADE ONLY (101093)	No Bid	No Bid	\$187.50	\$157.50	DMS	No Bid	\$1,065.00
5	150 EA	BOLTS MACHINE 5/8 X 10 GALV J-8810 OR EQUAL U.S. MADE ONLY REA APPROVED. 25/BX(101096)	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$145.50	DMS	No Bid	\$1,240.50
6	100 EA	BOLTS MACHINE 5/8 X 12 GALV. J-8812 OR EQUAL APPROVED U.S. MADE ONLY REA APPROVED 25/BX (101097)	No Bid	No Bid	\$192.00	\$110.00	DMS	No Bid	\$863.00
TOTAL OF GROUP A			No Bid	No Bid	\$1,915.00	\$1,383.00	DMS	No Bid	\$4,029.50
SUPPLIES (NO-SUB)									
1	400 EA	CONNECTOR CRIMPIT YP25U25 BURNDY NO-SUB 100/BX (101219)	No Bid	\$1,080.00	\$1,060.00	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$2,896.00	\$1,052.00
2	150 EA	CONNECTOR CRIMPIT YPC33R33R BURNDY NO-SUB(101225)	No Bid	\$862.50	\$592.50	No Bid	\$937.50	\$1,633.50	\$840.00
3	50 EA	CONNECTOR CRIMPIT 2/0 - 397 YPC33R26U BURNDY NO-SUB (101222)	No Bid	\$125.00	\$197.50	No Bid	\$137.50	\$173.00	\$120.00
4	25 EA	SLEEVE 394.5 FULL TENSION YDS32LT BURNDY NO-SUB. 25/BX(101572)	No Bid	\$1,325.00	\$1,336.25	No Bid	\$1,450.00	\$1,679.50	\$1,370.00
TOTAL OF GROUP B			No Bid	\$3,392.50	\$3,186.25	No Bid	\$3,725.00	\$6,382.00	\$3,382.00
GROUP C - ITEM BY ITEM									
1	12 EA	ARM SINGLE FLOOD ALUM DARK BRONZE SF18-DB TURN UP SLEXINGTON #EQ-701-DB,OR AMI-40DBZ FOR FLOOD OR TURNPIKE LIGHTS NO-SUB(101117)	No Bid	\$744.00	\$573.60	\$600.00	\$696.00	No Bid	\$621.00
2	50 EA	ARRESTOR LARGE BLOC 10KV W/CROSSARM BRACKET JOSYLN,COOPER,OR GE. (POLMER TYPE) HVY DUTY NO-SUB (101040)	No Bid	\$1,697.50	\$1,554.50	\$1,725.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

2019 Utility Electrical Supplies Bid

Vendor		Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO	
3	24 EA	ARRESTOR ELBOW LIGHTING 10KV 8132B0010J001 JOS GE,OR REA APPROVED EQUAL(101038)	No Bid	\$1,362.00	\$2,073.36	\$1,560.00	\$1,608.00	No Bid	\$1,404.00
4	50 EA	BOLTS BRONZE 1/2" X 1 1/2" STD. THREAD GRADE (101062)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$112.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$142.50
5	25 EA	BRACKET HOUSE TYPE JOSLYN J-0558Z OR APPROVED EQUAL 25/BX (101119)	No Bid	\$132.50	\$127.50	\$119.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$128.75
6	200 EA	BRACKET RIGID NEUTRAL, DC5C2 OR J-093 GALV OR APPROVED EQUAL U.S.MADE ONLY 25/BX (101112)	No Bid	\$790.00	\$660.00	\$580.00	\$800.00	No Bid	\$750.00
7	48 EA	BULB STREET LIGHT 250 HPS.(101134)	\$336.00	\$475.20	\$307.20	\$288.00	No Bid	\$276.00	\$309.60
8	72 EA	BULB STREET LIGHT 400 HPS LU400 (101139)	\$550.80	\$730.80	\$464.40	\$450.00	No Bid	\$414.00	\$486.00
9	30 EA	BUSHING LOAD BREAK 15KV RTE #2604797BO COOPER # LB1215,GE OR ELASTIMOLD 1601A4 ONLY.(101147)	No Bid	\$661.50	\$658.50	\$675.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$630.00
10	100 EA	CABLE SEALING KIT (RA-CHEM) WRAP #WCSM- 51-16 AND STRIP #S-1085-3-380 NO-SUB (101150)	No Bid	\$460.00	No Bid	\$708.75	No Bid	\$3,246.00	No Bid
11	125 EA	CLAMP HOTLINE SMALL BRONZE TIN-PLATED ALL PURPOSE ANDERSON BC2/0-FTP OR APPROVED EQUAL (101165)	No Bid	\$1,300.00	\$1,318.75	\$900.00	\$1,312.50	No Bid	\$1,106.25
12	200 EA	CLAMP WEDGE SM BLKBURN W62-1 NO-SUB 100/BX (101166)	\$390.00	\$248.00	\$238.00	\$250.00	\$340.00	\$326.00	No Bid
13	200 EA	CLAMP WEDGE MED 2/0 BLACKBURN W20-1 NO-SUB 50/BX (101167)	\$586.00	\$328.00	\$342.00	\$340.00	\$450.00	\$520.00	No Bid
14	200 EA	CONNECTOR CRIMPIT 4/0 TO 2/0 WR399 BLACKBURN (NO- SUB)(101217)	\$220.00	\$128.00	\$134.00	\$140.00	\$240.00	\$194.00	No Bid
15	250 EA	CONNECTOR COMPRESSION BLACKBURN WR159 H-TAP DESIGN NO SUB (101221)	\$147.50	\$80.00	\$97.50	\$95.00	\$135.00	\$125.00	No Bid
16	10 EA	CONNECTOR SPADE 4 HOLE BRONZE <u>TIN PLATED</u> ALL PURPOSE FARGO (2JJ6A4N-PLATED) 350-500 MCM NO SUB (101233)	No Bid	No Bid	\$720.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	15 EA	CONNECTOR SPADE 5/8" <u>TIN PLATED</u> BRONZE SQUARE ESP BXS-582-BN (101237)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$315.00	No Bid	No Bid
18	10 EA	CONNECTOR SPADE FARGO BRONZE <u>TIN PLATED</u> 1-350 ALL PURPOSE(JJ5A2N-PLATED)OR TREGO EQUAL NO-SUB.(101244)	No Bid	No Bid	\$610.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO
19	7 EA	CONNECTOR SPADE 4 HOLE BRONZE TIN PLATED ALL PURPOSE FARGO(2JJ7A2N-PLATED) 2-500-700 MCM OR TREGO EQUAL NO-SUB (101247)	No Bid	No Bid	\$644.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	12 EA	CONNECTOR SPADE TIN PLATED BRONZE FARGO (JJ6A2N- PLATED)ALL PURPOSE OR TREGO EQUAL NO-SUB.(101252)	No Bid	No Bid	\$612.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	25 EA	CROSS ARM DEAD-END ARM 8FT. EXTRA HEAVY DUTY FIBERGLASS BRACELESS PUPI #DA3000096E2B7X2 ULTIMATE HORIZONTAL LOAD BONDED SUNGUARD II COATING FIBERGLASS INTERNAL BUSHINGS AND FOAM FILLED (NO-SUB) (101286)	No Bid	\$5,750.00	No Bid	\$5,875.00	\$6,875.00	No Bid	\$6,143.75
22	50 EA	CROSS ARM 8FT. EXTRA HEAVY DUTY FIB BRACELESS PUPI #TB300009603X2 (NO-SUB.) (101290) WEIGHT WITH FORMED MOUNT 53 LBS, UTIMATE LOAD PER SIDE TO BE MIN. OF 10,000 LBS PER SIDE WITH GREY PATENTED THERMALLY BONDED SUNGUARD II COATING FIBERGLASS INTERNAL BUSHINGS AND FOAM FILLED. NO-SUB.	No Bid	\$9,250.00	No Bid	\$8,550.00	\$10,000.00	No Bid	\$8,930.00
23	100 EA	DEADEND 3/8 PREF GDE 1107, CHANCE OR PREFORM NO-SUB (101297)	No Bid	No Bid	\$245.00	\$265.00	\$260.00	No Bid	No Bid
24	6 EA	ELL 4" PVC 90 DEGREE SCH 40 APPROX. 36" LONG ELETRICAL (101299)	\$111.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$132.00	No Bid	\$84.00	\$166.50
25	50 EA	HOG EAR GUY ATTACHMENT, UNIVERSAL,MACLEAN #MGA345 OR APPROVED EQUAL, FOR USE WITH FIBERGLASS RODS (101362)	No Bid	\$250.00	\$249.50	\$252.50	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid
26	180 EA	INS BELL POLY PIN 15KV F-NECK 1" R GREY HENDRIX HPI-55-4 OR APPROVED EQUAL (.101379)	No Bid	\$936.00	\$952.20	\$954.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	180 EA	INS POLY SUSP DE 15KV SILICONE. APP-15SKCE-S OR APPORVED EQUAL (101380)	No Bid	\$1,584.00	\$1,776.60	\$1,710.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,413.00

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO
28	24 EA	LIGHT FLOOD BRONZE 1000 WATT LED 4' CORD LENGTH CORD INSTALLED THRU SLIPFITTER - KNUCKLE, 32,000 LUMEN MIN, 4000K MIN, MVOLT 120/277, TOOL LESS ENTRY, 3 PIN PHOTO CONTROL RECEPTACLE, AUTO SENSING VOLTAGE, ADJUSTABLE FROM HORIZONTAL TO 90 DEGREES UPWARD MAX, NO REFLECTORS, UTILITY GRADE OR APPROVED EQUAL (ACP1LED610AMVOLT 66 4K TM BZ RFD185976) (101391)	REBID	REBID	REBID	REBID	REBID	REBID	REBID
29	60 EA	LIGHT STREET GREY 250W-400W LED COOPER LIGHTNING (NO SUB) NVNAE04EUT310K4AP Navion 4 cube 213W (GREY)COLOR) TYPE 3 PATTERN, 20,000 LUMEN MIN, 4000K MIN,AUTO SENSING VOLTAGE IF AVAILABLE, NO REFLECTORS, UTILITY GRADE (101397)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$37,200.00	DMS	\$39,720.00	No Bid
30	100 EA	LIGHT SECURITY GREY COOPER LIGHTING CARETAKER 40W LED MODEL CRTKAA08E1205SRA OR AMAX-40-5K-6-V-D EVLUMA AREA MAX 40W, TYPE 5 PATTERN, 4000 LUMEN MIN, 4000K MIN, AUTO SENSING VOLTAGE IF AVAILABLE, NO REFLECTORS, UTILITY GRADE OR APPROVED EQUAL (RULHT5MEC40K-12UFNES) (101393)	No Bid	\$9,200.00	\$8,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$12,100.00	\$10,425.00	\$9,000.00
31	2 EA	METER SOCKET 2 GANG 200 AMP U1252-RDL-K1 MILBANK NO-SUB (101434)	No Bid	\$684.00	\$328.00	\$372.30	\$800.00	\$680.00	\$410.80
32	20 EA	METER SOCKET 200 AMP OVERHEAD WITH 2 1/2" HUB.U7021-EL-TG (7410) MILBANK NO-SUB. (101436)	No Bid	\$826.00	\$770.00	\$795.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,740.00	\$877.00
33	18 EA	METER SOCKET 13 TERMINAL 1PC RINGLESS COVER W/TEST BLOCK(PRE-WIRED AS PER THE CITY OF DOUGLAS, GEORGIA COLOR CODED WIRING SPECIFICATIONS ON FILE BROOKS COMPANY /ESKROM COMPANY)[BROOKS 602-3010C13-842] NO-SUB.(101440)	No Bid	\$3,870.00	\$3,973.50	\$4,095.00	\$4,860.00	No Bid	\$3,780.00

2019 Utility Electrical Supplies Bid

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO
34	5 EA	MOUNT CLUSTER TRANSFORMER CLUSTER MOUNT J6866 OR APPROVED EQUAL TO FIT 50 KVA OR LARGER TRANSFORMER (101452)	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$1,085.00	\$1,060.75	\$1,400.00	No Bid	\$1,151.75
35	5 EA	PAD TRANSFORMER CONCRETE REINFORCED 42"X 45" SOLID ONLY (101468)	No Bid	\$450.00	No Bid	\$395.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	10 EA	PLATE CLOSURE METER BASE LARGE MILBANK NO-SUB(101488)	No Bid	\$36.00	\$32.50	\$35.00	No Bid	\$35.50	\$40.00
37	15 EA	PLATE CLOSURE METER BASE SMALL MILBANK NO-SUB (101487)	No Bid	\$48.75	\$44.25	\$51.00	No Bid	\$48.75	\$45.00
38	300 EA	PHOTO CELL 1000 WATT 240 VOLT SUNTECH PART NUMBER: P124-8186: MULTI-VOLT (105-305), TIME DELAY, NEOPRENE GASKET, 380 JOULE MOV, BRONZE COLOR, MADE IN USA 100/BX (101474)	No Bid	\$1,500.00	\$1,335.00	\$1,500.00	No Bid	\$2,550.00	No Bid
39	12 EA	PLUG STAND OFF 15KV 161SOP ELASTIMOLD OR EQUAL(101493)	No Bid	\$358.80	\$358.80	\$378.00	\$384.00	\$518.40	\$379.80
40	45 EA	PIN POLE TOP 1" THREAD 18" LONG GALV. J-1368 OR COPPER DP19P6 20"LONG OR EQUAL(101481) COPPER DP19P6 20"LONG OR EQUAL(101481)	No Bid	\$339.75	\$296.10	\$281.25	\$371.25	No Bid	\$255.15
41	24 EA	POTHEAD-RAYCHEM TERMATOR KIT #2-3/0 15KV.UD CA# HVT-Z-151-SJ AND PENN UNION #PSKS-02-6. NO-SUB. (101516)	No Bid	\$1,380.00	No Bid	\$2,394.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42	15 EA	SHOE DEADEND FOR 394 STRAIGHT ANDERSON ADE88N (101549)	No Bid	\$202.50	No Bid	\$276.75	\$240.00	No Bid	No Bid
43	20 EA	SHOE DEADEND ALUM 1/0 - 397.5 PG70N SHOE DEADEND ALUM 1/0 -397.5 PG70N OR QDA74N OR APPROVED EQUAL (101561)	No Bid	\$405.00	\$378.00	\$369.00	\$340.00	No Bid	\$356.00
44	12 EA	TAPE ELECTRICAL UNDERGROUND WARNING 6" X 1000'. RED / BLACK LETTERING (101620)	No Bid	\$264.00	\$204.36	\$216.60	No Bid	\$252.00	\$275.40
45	6 EA	TRANSFORMER CURRENT BUSHING 400:5 750X36G204 OR APPROVED EQUAL(101637)	No Bid	\$456.00	No Bid	\$468.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$447.00
46	6 EA	TRANSFORMER CURRENT 400:5 WINDOW 3" OPENING WITH BASE 750X33G303 OR APPROVED EQUAL(101639)	No Bid	\$432.00	No Bid	\$486.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$435.00

		Vendor	Coley Electric	Irby	Anixter	GRESKO	Tri-State	Lowe	WESCO
47	6 EA	TRANSFORMER CURRENT 600:5 AMP BUSHING TYPE 92355-003 OR APPROVED EQUAL(101640)	No Bid	\$456.00	No Bid	\$468.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$460.50
48	3 EA	TRANSFORMER CURRENT 800:5 BUSH TYPE 750X33G336 OR APPROVED EQUAL(101643)	No Bid	\$228.00	No Bid	\$234.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$237.00
49	12 EA	TRANSFORMER POTENTIAL 2.4:1 288/120V 7526A10G0GE, ABB, SANGAMO OR APPROVED EQUAL(101687)	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,227.80	\$1,560.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Awarded Bid Totals			\$0.00	\$11,742.50	\$19,705.76	\$51,860.75	\$655.00	\$774.00	\$6,525.15

Recommend awarding as follows:

Vendor	Group(s)	Total
Irby - Kennesaw, GA	Line: 3,10,13,14,15, 21,26,41,42,46,47,48	\$11,742.50
Anixter- Norcross, GA	Group B, Line: 1,2,12,16,18,19, 20,23,25,30,31,32,36,37,38,39,44	\$19,705.76
Gresco - Forsyth, GA	Group A, line: 4,5,6,11,22,29,34,35, 49	\$51,860.75
Tri-State - Havana, FL	Line: 17,43	\$655.00
Lowe - Tifton, GA	Line: 7,8,24	\$774.00
Wesco - Fairbank, GA	Line: 9,27,33,40,45	\$6,525.15
Grand Total of All Bids		\$91,263.16

Group C line item 39 was decided by coin toss, witnessed by Anthony Folsom and Nikki Thompson

Do to grammatical error on Group C line item 28, item will be removed from this bid at this time and rebid at a later date.

Vendors not responding:

Late Bid Received:
CED of Valdosta, GA on 2-27-19 @ 9:13am